Produce Items Sysco Daylight General Produce Gold Star Ag Link
Line # Item description Size Case Ct Usage Price Zone Comments Price | Zone Comments Price | Zone Comments Price | Zone Comments Price | Zone Comments
1 Apple, Red/Green 1/2¢c 198 850 |SEE BELOW Washington $25.50 $20.50 $23.99 3 $24.00 2|San Joaquin
RED APPLE $19.00 Washington
GREEN APPLE $25.35 Washington
2 Apples, Sliced 1/2c 200 1,446 $37.15 $46.00] 2 |Stockton $45.00 $41.75 3 $42.50 2|San Joaquin
3 Banana, Petite 1/2c 150 1,191 $19.96 no local option $18.35 $18.00 $19.75 3 NO BID
4 Bell Pepper, Green Jul 5lb 4/5Ib 2 $14.84| 3 $14.85] 3 |Bakersfield $59.00| 2 |Fresno (seasonal) $45.75 3 NO BID
5 Bell Pepper, Red Jul 5lb 4/5lb 7 NO BID 8 $15.85| 3 |Bakersfield $70.00] 2 |[Fresno (seasonal) $53.50 3 NO BID
6 Blueberry 12ct case 17 $18.84 8 $24.75 $28.00f 3 |Oxnard (seasonal) $39.75 2 NO BID
7 Broccoli Floret Iceless 3lb 4/3lb 417 $19.72| 3 |Salinas $5.15| 2 |[Salinas $18.75| 3 [Salinas (seasonal) $23.50 2 $19.20 3|Salinas
8 Cabbage Green Shred 5lb 4/5lb 19 $13.36] 3 |Salinas $4.15] 2 |Salinas $15.50] 3 |Salinas (seasonal) $14.25 2 $20.25 3|Salinas
9 Cabbage Red Shred 5lb 4/5lb 19 $16.16] 3 |Salinas $4.85] 2 |[Salinas $15.00] 3 [Salinas (seasonal) $14.25 2 $21.25 3|Salinas
10 Carrott/Broccoli Bagged 20z 100 389 $30.02| 3 |Salinas $39.00] 3 |Fresno $50.00] 3 |Bakersfield/Salinas $33.75 3 $39.75 3|Salinas
11 Carrot, Matchstick 5lb 4/5lb 1 $15.44| 3 |Salinas $4.50] 3 |Fresno $14.00|] 3 |[Bakersfield $15.25 3 $16.50 3|salinas
12 Carrot, Shredded 1/6" 5lb 4/5lb 60 $15.44 3 |Salinas $4.50] 3 |Fresno $16.00 3 |Bakersfield $15.25 8 NO BID
13 Carrot, Mini Peeled 30z 100ct 1,393 $19.03| 2 $17.95| 3 |Fresno $20.00| 3 |[Bakersfield $19.90 3 $19.25 3|salinas
14 Cauliflower, Florets 3lb 4/31b 4 $12.25| 3 |Salinas $6.85] 2 |Salinas $28.50| 3 |Salinas (seasonal) $28.85 8 $24.75 3|Salinas
15 Celery Stick 5lb 4/5lb 557 $20.85| 3 $7.15| 3 |Oxnard $27.00|] 3 [Salinas (seasonal) $25.99 3 $23.75 3|Salinas
16 Cucumber, Whole 5lb 5lb 1,442 $8.79] 3 $5.50] 3 |Fresno (seasonal) $10.00f 3 |Fresno (seasonal) $5.99 2 $7.25 1|Stanislaus
17 Grape, Lunch Bunch 20z 150ct 981 $50.94| 2 $23.00] 3 |Fresno $28.00] 3 |[Fresno (seasonal) $24.25 3 $27.65 3|Fresno
18 Jicams, Sticks 4"x3/8" 5lb 4/5lb 740 $9.38 3 $10.45 $40.00 $38.00 8 NO BID
19 Kiwi 20lb 108ct 555 $26.85| 3 $22.00] 3 |Fresno $24.00| 3 |[Red Bluff (seasonal) | $21.25 3 $23.50 3|Fresno
20 Lemons 5lb 10 $11.39] 2 $7.00 $8.00 3 |Oxnard $8.45 3 NO BID
21 Lettuce, Butter head 24ct 4 $22.98| 3 |Salinas $14.50] 2 |[Salinas $15.25| 3 [Salinas (seasonal) $47.75 2 NO BID
22 Lettuce, Green Leaf Crown 10lb 80 SEE BELO 3 |Salinas $17.00] 2 |Salinas $21.00f 3 |Salinas (seasonal) $21.50 1 $18.75 3|Salinas
LETTUCE GREEN LEAF CROWNS $16.39 3 |Salinas
LETTUCE GREEN LEAF FRSH W/LINR $9.12 3 |Salinas
23 Lettuce, Romaine chopped 2lb 6/2Ib 466 $15.17| 3 |Salinas $3.85] 2 |[Salinas $17.50| 3 [Salinas (seasonal) $16.25 1 $18.75 3|Salinas
24 Lettuce, Shredded 5lb 4/5lb 108 SEE BELO 3 |Salinas $3.75] 2 |Salinas $15.00f 3 |Salinas (seasonal) $14.25 1 $15.95 3|Salinas
LETTUCE SHREDDED 1/4 IN FRESH $13.29 3 |Salinas
LETTUCE SHREDDED 1/8 FRESH $13.29 3 |Salinas
25 Lettuce, Spring Mix 3lb 518 $6.80] 3 |Salinas $9.50] 2 |[Salinas $9.35| 3 |Salinas (seasonal) $12.99 1 $13.00 3|Salinas
26 Mandarin-Clementine size 18/21 1/2c 100ct $23.51| 3 $22.00] 3 |Orange Cove $23.00f 3 |Dinuba $23.99 3 $28.95 3|Fresno
27 Mandarin-Satsuma 25lb 100ct $46.34| 3 $22.00] 3 |Orange Cove $23.00| 3 |[Dinuba $23.99 3 $28.50 3|Fresno
28 Melon, Cantaloupe 9-12ct $15.54| 2 $16.25| 1 |Patterson $18.00f 3 |Fresno (seasonal) $14.99 3 $12.50 1|Stanislaus
29 Melon, Honeydew 6ct $13.37| 2 $15.00] 1 |Patterson $18.00] 3 |[Fresno (seasonal) $14.75 3 $9.75 1|Stanislaus
30 Melon, Watermelon sdless 4ct 2 $27.50| 3 $20.00] 2 |Manteca $27.00f 3 |Fresno (seasonal) $22.49 3 $24.00 1|Stanislaus
31 Nectarines, White size 60/64 25lb 85ct 348 $29.25| 1 $21.00] 3 |Kingsburg $22.00] 3 [Reedley $21.79 2 $23.50 3|Fresno
32 Necatrines, Yellow 1/2¢c 96ct 259 NO BID 1 $21.00] 3 |Kingsburg $22.00] 3 |Reedley $21.79 2 $22.75 3|Fresno
33 Oranges, Cara cara 40lb 138 $38.65| 3 $20.50] 3 |Orange Cove $37.00] 3 |[Orange Cove $28.50 2 $19.75 3|Fresno
34 Oranges, Navel 40lb 138 733 $18.19| 3 $16.95] 3 |Orange Cove $19.00f 3 |Reedley $18.75 2 $17.00 3|Fresno
35 Oranges, Valencia 40lb 138 $26.56| 3 $16.95| 3 |Orange Cove $24.00] 3 [Reedley $18.75 2 $17.00 3|Fresno
36 Pea, Snap 10lb 7 $22.63| 3 $28.85| 2 |[Salinas $24.00| 3 [Salinas (seasonal) $26.00 2 NO BID
37 Pea, Snow 10lb 14 SEE BELO 3 $28.85| 2 |[Salinas $30.00] 3 |Salinas (seasonal) $23.00 2 NO BID




PEA SNOW FRESH $26.85 3
PEA SNOW FRSH $18.07 3
38 Peaches, White 1/2¢c 90 190 $26.56| 1 $21.00] 3 |Kingsburg $22.00] 3 [Reedley $21.79 2 $22.50 3|Fresno
39 Peaches, Yellow 1/2¢c 96 377 1 $21.00] 3 |Kingsburg $22.00] 3 [Reedley $21.79 2 $21.95 3|Fresno
PEACH FRESH LOCAL GROWN $29.10 1
PEACH FRESH $27.60 1
40 Pear, red/green 40lb 135-150ct 688 $22.23 $24.95 $27.00 $23.99 3 $22.50 2|San Joaquin
41 Pineapple, Fresh 7ct $15.50 no local option $17.50 $15.00 $17.99 3 NO BID
42 Plouts size 50/55 28lb 145ct 32 NO BID 1 $22.00] 3 |Kingsburg $27.50] 3 |Reedley $21.79 2 $24.50 3|Fresno
43 Plums, size 140/154ct 28lb 140 346 $30.21| 1 $20.00] 3 |Kingsburg $22.00| 3 [Reedley $21.79 2 $23.50 3|Fresno
44 Radish Cleaned 25lb 7 $26.04 8 $28.50 $25.50 $28.25 2 NO BID
45 Spinach cleaned 2.5lb 4/2.5lb 1 $14.42| 3 $4.75| 2 |Salinas $16.00|] 3 [Oxnard (seasonal) $15.50 1 $13.00 3|Salinas
46 Strawberries 8X1 clamshells 1lb 8/1lb 1,212 $15.28| 3 $3.50] 2 |Watsonville $19.50] 3 |Salinas (seasonal) $19.99 2 $19.50 3|Salinas
47 Tomato Bulk 5X6 25lb 102 |SEE BELO 8 $18.95 Fresno (seasonal) $22.00| 3 |[San Diego (seasonal] $19.99 3 $20.50 2|San Joaquin
TOMATO BULK UTILITY FRESH $13.42 3
TOMATO BULK 5X6 FRESH $26.46 8
TOMATO BULK #2 LOOSE FRESH $11.07 3
48 Tomato, Cherry flat 10lb 67 $16.07| 3 $17.00] 3 |Fresno (seasonal) $23.00| 3 |[San Diego (seasonal] $24.50 3 $21.65 2|San Joaquin
49 Tomato, Grape 10lb 187 $17.85| 3 $15.50] 3 |Fresno (seasonal) $18.00f 3 |San Diego (seasonal] $19.50 8 $19.75 2|San Joaquin
50 Yam Stick Bagged 20z 100ct 383 $19.11| 3 $36.00] 3 |Fresno $52.00| 2 [Livingston (seasonal)] $39.50 1 $26.00 3|Fresno
51 Zucchini Coins 1/4" 5lb 22 SEE BELO 3 $15.80] 3 |Fresno $12.75| 2 |Fresno (seasonal) $9.75 2 NO BID
SQUASH ZUCC FRSH 1/2 COIN CUT $11.20 8
SQUASH ZUCCHINI SLICED/COINS $11.20 3
52 Zucchini, Fresh 5lb $8.20 3 $7.75| 3 |Fresno $10.00] 2 |[Fresno (seasonal) $7.45 2 NO BID

Note: When evaluating produce, we take a few things into consideration in addition to price.

* Ability to deliver to individual sites vs a warehouse drop.

*The origin of the produce. We look to see if it is in zone 1, 2 or 3 (California Regions). We support local farmer so if you didn't indicate a zone, the we are assuming that the product is not from California.




